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Summary
A few rare or threatened plant species,
e.g. Grevillea iaspicula, G. wilkinsonii,
Discaria nitida and Astelia australiana,
are known to have at least some
populations under threat through habi-
tat invasion by blackberry. This contri-
bution focused on the threats posed to
the nationally endangered G. iaspicula
by blackberry invasion of its habitat. G.
iaspicula is a shrub confined to lime-
stone outcrops in the Wee Jasper area of
New South Wales, where it survives at
seven sites and has a total population of
less than 250 mature plants. Five popula-
tions are located on private land and two
are on public land. Browsing by domes-
tic stock and land clearing have been the
major past threats to survival of this
species. The remnant populations are

pose a major problem for managers of pri-
vate and public lands within the climatic
range of the Rubus fruticosus L. aggregate.
An estimated 8.8 m ha of infestations
occur throughout Australia, with conse-
quences which vary in type and signifi-
cance depending on the characteristics of
the site and the preferred land use.

At this stage it is not considered neces-
sary to undertake additional economic
work on blackberry. This is because of the
unambiguous nature of the biophysical
significance of blackberry infestations
(and therefore the presumed continuation
of funding for the current biological con-
trol research), coupled with the costs of
updating and improving the accuracy of
the current valuation of economic losses
as a consequence of those infestations.

If the research programs on biological
control currently underway are threat-
ened by lack of funding, or new programs
are considered necessary, it would be ap-
propriate to develop current estimates of
the costs of this significant weed. Appro-
priate approaches to the development of
estimates of the cost of blackberry would
include the use of partial and inverse eco-
nomic analyses.
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Impact of blackberry on an endangered species
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threatened currently by rampant inva-
sion of habitat by blackberry and sweet
briar (Rosa rubiginosa). Of the $18 000
spent on recovery actions for this species,
it is estimated that more than $5000 has
gone to the control of the woody weeds
blackberry and sweet briar. The various
problems encountered by the NSW Na-
tional Parks and Wildlife Service and the
Grevillea iaspicula Recovery Team in
achieving satisfactory control of these
woody weeds were discussed.


